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COMMISSIONERS’ COURT OF TITUS COUNTY, TEXAS 
SPECIAL MEETING 

July 26, 2010 
 

PUBLIC OFFICIALS AND PUBLIC ATTENDING: 
 

Sam W. Russell, County Judge    Don Boggs, Commissioner Pct 1  
Mike Fields, Commissioner Precinct 2   Phillip Hinton, Commissioner Pct 3  
Thomas Hockaday, Commissioner Precinct 4  Teresa Price, County Clerk 
Carl Johnson, County Auditor    Debby Rhea, County Treasurer 
John Livingston, Chief Deputy    Captain Brad Fosdick, Sheriff’s Office 
Debra Abston, District Clerk    Leonard Rockwell, Elections Administrator  
Joyce Simpson, Asst to County Judge   Jerene Sarratt, County Clerk’s Office 
Paul Lindsey, Chief Investigator    Norma Narramore    
Mike Ahrens      Jennie Taraborelli 
Brian Lee      Jon Roach 
Donna Elmore      Emily Elmore 
Darlene Long      Justin Long 
Mack Long      Lou Antonelli 
 
 

Judge Sam Russell called the Special Meeting to order at 9:05 a.m. on July 26, 2010 stating that 
for the record, notices had been posted for the appropriate amount of time preceding the 
meeting.   
 
Judge Russell led the Commissioners’ Court in the Pledge of Allegiance.  Commissioner Mike 
Fields followed with the invocation.   
 
1.  Public Comments and/or Requests for Information on Non-agenda Items in accordance 

with Section 551.042, Texas Opens Meetings Act 
There were no public comments and/or requests for information on non-agenda items. 
 
2. Presentation on Loop Project 
Jennie Taraborelli with Pate Transportation Partners updated the Commissioners Court on the 
Loop Project by beginning with the Public Hearing held on the FM 1000 project on July 22, 2010 
at the Titus County Extension Office.  They only received one (1) comment at the meeting and 
one (1) comment by email.  One concern dealt with drainage issues and the other was with a 
request to build bridges and culverts on McKellar road.  By law, you have 10 days from the date 
of the Public Hearing to provide additional comments.  In order for these comments to be 
included in the public hearing record, they must be postmarked by August 5, 2010. The 
Environmental team will compile the comments and they will be forwarded to TxDOT.  They 
hope to have findings by the first of October.  At that time, they can move into ROW 
acquisition. 
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Ms. Taraborelli went on to say that the United States Army Corps of Engineers has completed 
granting permits and archeological mitigation has been secured.  Environmental clearance is 
nearing the end.   
 
The condemnation hearing for the final parcel necessary for construction on US 271 was held 
July 16.  This will clear the final obstacle to construction activities on US 271.  The 
condemnation proceedings for the remaining parcels are scheduled for later this summer.  Full 
access to these parcels was secured under Possession and Use Agreements to accommodate 
construction.   
 
ROW acquisition is ongoing for the FM 2348 project.  Offers have been made on twenty of the 
twenty-four parcels necessary for this project.  Several property owners have accepted the 
offer and negotiations are ongoing on the remainder of parcels. 
 
The design for all three projects is nearing completion.  The critical path includes ROW 
acquisition for FM 2348; receipt of FONSI on FM 1000; commencement of US 271 Clearing and 
Grubbing and the completion of design for US 271.  Active construction should begin by the 
middle of February, 2011. 
 
3.  Consider and Possibly Approve Minutes Regular Meeting of the Commissioners Court on  

June 14, 2010, Special Meeting on June 28, 2010 and Regular Meeting on July 12, 2010  
Commissioner Don Boggs would like to meet with Jerene Sarratt after the meeting to go over 
minor corrections.  Since this will be the official minutes, motion was made by Commissioner 
Don Boggs and seconded by Commissioner Phillip Hinton to table the minutes until corrections 
were made.  Motion carried unanimously. 
 
4. Consider and Possibly Take Action on Employee Life Insurance 
County Auditor, Carl Johnson, informed the court that a couple of years ago, the County put in 
place that they provide life insurance up to 2 x salary.  After the IRS audit this year, it was 
determined that anything over $50,000 would be considered income with retirement and taxes 
having to be taken out.    If we left it the way it is, we would have to publish this as an increase 
in salary benefit for all elected officials.  His recommendation is that we set a cap of $50,000.   
 
Motion was made by Commissioner Thomas Hockaday to stay with a $50,000 cap including the 
elected officials.  Commissioner Don Boggs seconded this motion but also added an 
amendment that the words “double your salary” be removed.  After much discussion, 
Commissioner Hockaday and Commissioner Boggs withdrew their motion and the amendment 
to the motion.  Motion was then made by Commissioner Don Boggs and seconded by 
Commissioner Mike Fields to table this item until Mr. Johnson could work up a proposal as to 
the cost.  Motion carried unanimously. 
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5. Open Bids and Consider and Possibly Approve the following: 
a.  Washed Gravel (3/8” to Number 10) 
H. E. Spann - $20.49 per Ton Delivered 
Hanson Aggregates, Inc.  $10.50 Per Ton to be picked up at their plant, Little River 
R. L. Gerhart Excavating, Inc. -         Pick Up   Delivered to County Barn 
                                            Yard      Ton                   Yard                   Ton 
  3/8 to #4 Pea Gravel              $30.00     $22.22                       $32.50              $24.07 
  3/8 Type D class A (chips)      $34.00    $25.19                       $36.50              $27.04  
 

Motion was made by Commissioner Thomas Hockaday and seconded by Commissioner Phillip 
Hinton to accept the bid from Hanson Aggregates @ $10.50 per ton.  Motion carried 
unanimously. 
 

b. Crushed Iron Ore (Maximum 1” Screen Size) 
Seaton Construction, Inc. – Picked up at pit in Morris County - $10.00 per CY p/u 
                                            Picked up at Cookville - $14.00 per CY p/u 
                                            Pct. #1                            $18.20 per CY Del. 
 

Motion was made by Commissioner Don Boggs and seconded by Commissioner Phillip Hinton 
to approve the bid from Seaton Construction, Inc. for crushed iron ore (maximum 1” screen 
size).  Motion carried unanimously. 
 
6. Open Bids and Consider and Possibly Approve the following: 

a.  Sawmill Equipment 
Log In-Feed Deck – No bid received  
Bark Conveyor – Cypress Lumber - $50.00 
Cut up System – No bid received 
Log Transfer Deck – No bid received 
Morbark 632 Debarker – No bid received 
Electric Control Bank – Cypress Lumber - $300.00 
Log Deck In-feed to Mill – No bid received 
Berry 225 Feed Work and Carriage Drive – Cypress Lumber - $100.00 
PATZ barn sweep clean out conveyer – 60’ – Cypress Lumber - $50.00 
Corley Tong Dog – No bid received 
Automatic Saw Tailor – No bid received 
Sawyers Cab with Controls – No bid received 
Out-feed conveyor from carriage – No bid received 
Brewster 6” combination gang edger – Cypress Lumber - $1000 
Electric control bank – Cypress Lumber - $1000 
100 HP Motor, Saw Mandrel and Husk – Cypress Lumber - $100.00 
Saw Room – No bid received 
15’ Saw Dust Conveyor – Cypress Lumber - $100.00 
15’ Dust Conveyor – Cypress Lumber - $100.00 
16” x 75’ belt Conveyor – Cypress Lumber - $300.00 
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Live Roll Bed – Cypress Lumber - $300.00 
Green Chain Conveyor – Cypress Lumber - $300.00 
Live Roller Bed – Cypress Lumber - $300.00 
Gravity Roller Beds – Cypress Lumber - $50.00 
Morbark Chip Pac – Cypress Lumber - $700.00; W. L. S. Sawmill, Inc. - $1181.00 
Morbark Chip Blower – Cypress Lumber - $500.00 
Scale House – Cypress Lumber - $500.00; W. L. S. Sawmill, Inc. – 562.00 
Bridgeport Deck Scales – Cypress Lumber - $4495.00; W. L. S. Sawmill, Inc. - 
$10,212.00 
Corinth Bar Type Log Turner – No bid received 
 

Motion was made by Commissioner Don Boggs and seconded by Commissioner Phillip Hinton 
to accept the bid from W.L.S. Sawmill, Inc. in the amount of $10,212.00 for the Bridgeport Deck 
Scales; the scale house in the amount of $562.00 and the Morbark Chip Pac in the amount of 
$1181.00.  Motion carried unanimously. 
 
There was also a bid received from W.L.S. Sawmill for the Electric Control Bank for $1128.  Since 
it was unclear which electric control bank this bid was for, motion was made by Commissioner 
Don Boggs and seconded by Commissioner Phillip Hinton to rebid the Electric Control Banks 
with designated specific information for each.  Motion carried unanimously. 
 
Motion was made by Commissioner Don Boggs and seconded by Commissioner Phillip Hinton 
to accept the bid from Cypress Lumber for the following remaining items:   

 Bark conveyor - $50 

 Berry 225 Feed Work and Carriage Drive - $100 

 PATZ barn sweep clean out conveyer – 60’ - $50 

 Brewster 6” combination gang edger - $1000 

 100 HP Motor, Saw Mandrel and Husk - $100 

 15’ saw Dust Conveyor - $100 

 15’ Dust Conveyor - $100 

 16” x 75’ Belt Conveyor - $300 

 Live roll bed - $300 

 Green Chain conveyor - $300 

 Live roller bed - $300 

 Gravity roller beds - $50 

 Mobark Chip blower - $500 
Motion carried unanimously. 
 
Motion was made by Commissioner Don Boggs and seconded by Commissioner Mike Fields to 
rebid all remaining items that no bid was received on in one (1) lot.    Motion carried 
unanimously. 
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b.  Buildings and Sheds 
Office Building  
Jeremy Daniels - $1122.77; David Elmore - $612.75; Jon Cypress Lumber - $200.00 

Motion was made by Commissioner Don Boggs and seconded by Commissioner Thomas 
Hockaday to accept the bid from Jeremy Daniels in the amount of $1122.77 for the office 
building.    Motion carried unanimously. 
 
      Wooden Shed – David Elmore – $18.00 
Motion was made by Commissioner Don Boggs and seconded by Commissioner Phillip Hinton 
to accept the bid from David Elmore in the amount of $18.00 for the Wooden Shed. 
 
      Metal Warehouse A – No bid received 
                 Metal Warehouse B – No bid received 
                 Equipment Shed A – No bid received 
                 Equipment Shed B – Cypress Lumber - $100.00 
                 Metal Warehouse C – No bid received 
                 Saw Enclosure Building – No bid received 
                 Equipment Shed C – Cypress Lumber - $100.00 
                 Metal Warehouse and Equipment Shed – No bid received 
Motion was made by Commissioner Mike Fields and seconded by Commissioner Don Boggs to 
accept the bid from Cypress Lumber for Equipment Sheds B & C in the amount of $100.00 for 
each.  Motion carried unanimously. 
 
7. Consider and Possibly Approve Purchase of Poll Books for Elections Office from HAVA 

Funds or Chapter 19 Funds 
Leonard Rockwell, Elections Administrator, is trying to get all election workers to use the same 
equipment.  He is looking at getting 22 poll books because we have 22 machines.  He has the 
funds in the HAVA Grant and also Chapter 19 Funds from the Secretary of State.   
 
Motion was made by Commissioner Mike Fields and seconded by Commissioner Phillip Hinton 
to approve purchase of Poll Books for Elections Office from HAVA Funds or Chapter 19 Funds.  
Motion carried unanimously. 
 
8. Consider and Possibly Approve Travel and Seminars for Titus County Employees and 

Elected Officials 
Travel was submitted from: 

 County Attorney’s office for Kristen Frazier to attend a free training conference for 
Victims’ Voice in the Criminal Justice Process to be held in Texarkana July 28, 201 

 County Attorney to attend the Advanced Family law Course being held in San Antonio 
August 9-12 

  Sheriff’s office for Holly Bailey to attend TCIC Terminal Agency Coordinator Class in 
Austin on August 10th 

  Training On a Legal update course presented by the Titus County Sheriff’s Department 
on August 17 or 18th for Sheriff Tim Ingram; Chief John Livingston; Lts. Terry McDowell; 
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Brent Smith; Woody Hughes; Sgts. Mark Davis, Clint Bain, Brad Duncan, Marcus Carlock; 
Kenneth Wilson; Aaron Baxter; Paul Gordon; Tracy Hayes; Deps. David Robinson; 
Michael Kirkwood; Jason White; Wayne Minor; Austin Landrum; Sam Matus; Ashton 
Lewis; Shawn Davis; Rendy Orr; Craig Brown; Lt. Teresa Patterson; Gary Banks and 
Michael Brown 

  Deputy Shawn Davis and Deputy Ashton Lewis to attend Advanced Roadside Interview 
Techniques course August 9-10th in Kilgore  

 County Clerk Teresa Price and Charity Jeffery to attend Texas College of Probate Judges 
conference in Ft. Worth. 

 
Motion was made by Commissioner Mike Fields and seconded by Commissioner Don Boggs to 
approve travel and seminars for Titus County Employees and Elected Officials.  Motion carried 
unanimously. 
 
9. Approve Oral and Written Reports of County Officials 
There were no oral reports.  Written reports were received from County Clerk and the Auditor’s 
office.  Commissioner Boggs had some concerns regarding the Road & Bridge #2 Fund.  It 
appears that the figures are incorrect because of misplacement of comma.   
 
Motion was made by Commissioner Don Boggs and seconded by Commissioner Mike Fields to 
approve written reports of County Officials to include the change in Road & Bridge #2 Fund to 
show $115,758.90 instead of $11,575.89.   Motion carried unanimously. 
 
10.  Report from Shawn Bryant regarding County Computer System 
Mr. Bryant was not present.  Motion was made by Commissioner Mike Fields and seconded by 
Commissioner Phillip Hinton to table this item and place on the next agenda.  Motion carried 
unanimously. 
 
11. Approve Budget Amendments 
There were no budget amendments. 
 
12. Sign Pay Orders and Approve Payments 
Motion was made by Commissioner Thomas Hockaday and seconded by Commissioner Phillip 
Hinton to sign pay orders and approve payments.  Motion carried unanimously. 
 
13. Closing Comments by County Judge and Commissioners, if any 
Commissioner Mike Fields announced that the railroad replaced the cross arms on the railroad 
tracks located on CR 2400.   
 
Adjourn 
Motion was made by Commissioner Don Boggs and seconded by Commissioner Phillip Hinton 
to adjourn.  Motion carried unanimously. 


